

STEP 1

**-This is the ONLY Item Required to be submitted before the deadline of:
WEDNESDAY, MAY 20, 2015 AT 3:00 PM**

SCHEDULE "A"

PRICE SHEET

-REQUIRED AS A PART OF STEP 1-

**THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED BY THE DEADLINE OF:
Wednesday, May 20, 2015 at 3:00 PM**

The undersigned Bidder, having become familiar with this IFB agrees to furnish the goods and/or services in accordance with this IFB. Enter all pricing in this price sheet.

Any modification of this price sheet may be cause for disqualification.

Bidder Name: Crop Production Services

Enter Unit of Measure/Unite Price and Extended Price **using this price sheet only.**

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Quantity	MINIMUM PURCHASE QUANTITY	PURCHASE QUANTITY UNIT PRICE	Extended Price
1	RANGER PRO	2700 GAL	30 gallon drum	\$328.20	\$29,538.00
2	ELEMENT 3A	50 GAL	2.5 gallon jug	\$108.15	\$2,163.00
3	DUPONT PERSPECTIVE TM	25 LBS	5 pound jug	\$387.30	\$9,682.50
4	OPENSIGHT HERBICIDE	20 LBS	1.25 pound jug	\$102.50	\$1,640.00
5	ESPLANADE TM 200 SC	15 GAL	2.5 gallon jug	\$2,611.20	\$15,667.20
6	POWE RLINE	350 GAL	2.5 gallon jug	\$132.40	\$18,536.00
7	INVADE 80 SURFACTANT	80 GAL	2.5 gallon jug	\$25.00	\$800.00
8	TROOPER P+D (RESTRICTED HERBICIDE)	25 GAL	2.5 gallon jug	\$77.25	\$1,931.25

SCHEDULE "A"

PRICE SHEET

-REQUIRED AS A PART OF STEP 1-

**THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED BY THE DEADLINE OF:
Wednesday, May 20, 2015 at 3:00 PM**

The undersigned Bidder, having become familiar with this IFB agrees to furnish the goods and/or services in accordance with this IFB. Enter all pricing in this price sheet.

Any modification of this price sheet may be cause for disqualification.

Bidder Name: Red River Specialties, Inc. *-Jeane Culbertson (agent)*

Enter **Minimum Purchase Quantity** and **Purchase Quantity Unit Price** using this price sheet only.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Quantity	MINIMUM PURCHASE QUANTITY	PURCHASE QUANTITY UNIT PRICE
1	RANGER PRO	2700 GAL	1x30 gal drum	\$10.80 /gal
2	ELEMENT 3A	50 GAL	1 Case (2x2.5 gal)	\$43.15/gal
3	DUPONT PERSPECTIVE TM	25 LBS	1 Case (8x5lb)	\$77.46/lb
4	OPENSIGHT HERBICIDE	20 LBS	1 Case (6x1.25lb)	\$95.94/lb
5	ESPLANADE TM 200 SC	15 GAL	1 Case (2x2.5 gal)	\$1,044.48/gal
6	POWE RLINE	350 GAL	1 Case (2x2.5 gal)	\$53.00/gal
7	INVADE 80 SURFACTANT	80 GAL	1 Case (2x2.5 gal)	\$9.00/gal
8	TROOPER P+D (RESTRICTED HERBICIDE)	25 GAL	1 Case (2x2.5 gal)	\$30.00/gal

Bidding RRSI NIS by Red River Specialties

Bidding Grazon P+D by Dow AgroSciences

STEP 1

-This is the ONLY Item Required to be submitted before the deadline of:
WEDNESDAY, MAY 20, 2015 AT 3:00 PM

SCHEDULE "A"

PRICE SHEET

-REQUIRED AS A PART OF STEP 1-

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED BY THE DEADLINE OF:
Wednesday, May 20, 2015 at 3:00 PM

The undersigned Bidder, having become familiar with this IFB agrees to furnish the goods and/or services in accordance with this IFB. Enter all pricing in this price sheet.

Any modification of this price sheet may be cause for disqualification.

Bidder Name: V M Distribution Partners

Enter Unit of Measure/Unit Price and Extended Price using this price sheet only.

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Quantity	MINIMUM PURCHASE QUANTITY	PURCHASE QUANTITY UNIT PRICE
1	RANGER PRO	2700 GAL	120 gal	\$1,500 ⁰⁰
2	ELEMENT 3A	50 GAL	2.5 gal	\$118.75
3	DUPONT PERSPECTIVE TM	25 LBS	5 lbs	\$387.30
4	OPENSIGHT HERBICIDE	20 LBS	10 lbs	\$820.00
5	ESPLANADE TM 200 SC	15 GAL	2.5 gal	\$2611.20
6	POWE RLINE	350 GAL	2.5 gal	\$158.75
7	INVADE 80 SURFACTANT	80 GAL		NB
8	TROOPER P+D (RESTRICTED HERBICIDE)	25 GAL		NB

STEP 1

-This is the ONLY Item Required to be submitted before the deadline of:
WEDNESDAY, MAY 20, 2015 AT 3:00 PM

SCHEDULE "A" **PRICE SHEET**

-REQUIRED AS A PART OF STEP 1-

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED BY THE DEADLINE OF:
Wednesday, May 20, 2015 at 3:00 PM

The undersigned Bidder, having become familiar with this IFB agrees to furnish the goods and/or services in accordance with this IFB. Enter all pricing in this price sheet.

Any modification of this price sheet may be cause for disqualification.

Bidder Name: VET Corp Inc.

Enter Unit of Measure/Unite Price and Extended Price **using this price sheet only.**

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Quantity	MINIMUM PURCHASE QUANTITY	PURCHASE QUANTITY UNIT PRICE
1	RANGER PRO	2700 GAL	5 gal.	\$16.89
2	ELEMENT 3A	50 GAL	5 gal.	\$47.06
3	DUPONT PERSPECTIVE TM	25 LBS	no bid	
4	OPENSIGHT HERBICIDE	20 LBS	no bid	
5	ESPLANADE TM 200 SC	15 GAL	no bid	
6	POWE RLINE	350 GAL	no bid	
7	INVADE 80 SURFACTANT	80 GAL	no bid	
8	TROOPER P+D (RESTRICTED HERBICIDE)	25 GAL	no bid.	

STEP 1

**-This is the ONLY Item Required to be submitted before the deadline of:
WEDNESDAY, MAY 20, 2015 AT 3:00 PM**

SCHEDULE "A"

PRICE SHEET

-REQUIRED AS A PART OF STEP 1-

**THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED BY THE DEADLINE OF:
Wednesday, May 20, 2015 at 3:00 PM**

The undersigned Bidder, having become familiar with this IFB agrees to furnish the goods and/or services in accordance with this IFB. Enter all pricing in this price sheet.

Any modification of this price sheet may be cause for disqualification.

Bidder Name: Winfield Solutions

Enter Unit of Measure/Unit Price and Extended Price **using this price sheet only.**

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Quantity		MINIMUM PURCHASE QUANTITY	PURCHASE QUANTITY UNIT PRICE
1	RANGER PRO	2700	GAL	2.5	\$34.75
2	ELEMENT 3A	50	GAL	2.5	\$111.11
3	DUPONT PERSPECTIVE TM	25	LBS	1.25 lb	\$196.83
4	OPENSIGHT HERBICIDE	20	LBS	1.25 lb 10 lb	\$102.50
5	ESPLANADE TM 200 SC	15	GAL	1 gal 2.5 gal	\$1289.60 \$2611.20
6	POWE RLINE	350	GAL	2.5 gal	178.90
7	INVADE 80 SURFACTANT Top surf 80	80	GAL	2.5 gal	35.50
8	TROOPER P+D (RESTRICTED HERBICIDE) Grazon P+D	25	GAL	2.5 gal	74.85